
    1 | P a g e  

 

Forum Marketing Tips That 
Boost Your Business 
 

by: Ron Killian 

http://www.theplrstore.com 

DISCLAIMER: I am not a professional forum marketer. The follows is what I've 
found to work for me and what I’ve seen work for others. 

Can’t guarantee your mileage. 

 

 

 

http://www.theplrstore.com/
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So… 

There is no doubt that forums can drive traffic to your website. 

No big secret there. 

But SO many people do it wrong. 

Now, I am not that naive that I don't know some people (many it “seems”) only 
post on forums to get a link back or only to "try" and drive traffic. I know many 
folks are not there to even try to contribute in a meaningful way. Only getting 
what they want. 

Always going to be those who abuse. 

But… let’s get back to the positive. 

For those who want to brand themselves, build a reputation and actually build a 
business or an income, let's talk about it. 

For those who only want to use and abuse forums, stop reading now. I don't want 
to waste my breath or your time. 

Seriously, stop reading now if this doesn't pertain to you. 

Sure you want to continue? 

Is that your finally answer? 

I want to talk to the folks who are trying to build a serious business that lasts. 
That stands the test of time. 

You know who you are. 

One other thing, I know there are folks who might even say or think forum 
marketing is too time consuming to bother with. While I agree it can be a time 
suck (if you let it), there are a few important reasons it can be worth your effort. 
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Okay, since you asked… 

Benefits of Forum Marketing: 

Another traffic channel – Not every blog commenter hangs out on a forum and 
not every forum member comments on blog. Yep, another way to get new 
customers or clients. 

New Connections – I don’t know about you, but one of the best things I’ve found 
with blog commenting, is the people I’ve met and the new connections I’ve made. 
Priceless. Same holds true for forums. It can be a great way to network. You never 
know who you might make friends with. 

Branding – Here’s something I believe SO many people don’t give enough 
thought. We should always be branding our selves or our business. Now, I am not 
talking about constant promotion, that’s quite different. I am talking more about 
building your reputation. 

Stand Out - What makes forums a little “better” for branding is the fact that you 
can stand out a little more. Let’s be honest… your comment on a blog could and 
often does, get lost among the sea of replies. While a forum post usually gets 
more attention. Why? How? Most forum posts do not get 100’s of replies. There 
are some, and it depends on the forum, but they are far and few between. 

Now that we’ve covered the benefits, time to get to the tactics. 

The Center Of Attention 

One of the best aspects of a forum is that YOU can start your own posts. This is 
the REAL power. This is when you start to actually get seen as, or at the least be 
perceived as someone who knows something. 

This is where you start to build your reputation. 

The good stuff. 
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Now, I know putting up your own forum posts can be intimidating. Starting a post 
on some forums can be downright scary. But if you really want to be “someone”, 
you need to do this. 

Seriously. 

And you can do it. I know you can. 

If you’re a little skiddish about putting yourself out there, here’s a couple idea’s 
that might help… 

• Get some feedback BEFORE posting. Ask an online friend, heck even a family 
member, to read your post before you post it. 

• Start with smaller forums, they can be less intimidating and could help to build 
up your confidence. 

On to the next one… 

Be A Real Person 

Funny how people use their real name on places like facebook and other social 
platforms, but when it comes to forums, they often have all these strange names. 

Again, the strange named might not be concerned with branding. 

No problem. 

But if you want to brand yourself, it’s only common sense to use your REAL name. 

Who’s going to remember Krl422? 

Or some other weird, hard to pronounce or hard to spell member name. 

Make it easy for people to remember you and they will mention you more often. 
That’s when you become more. 
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Be a REAL part of the community 

Dang this should be so common sense, but unfortunately it’s not. 

Now, this one can be quite powerful if you do forum marketing correctly. It's 
something I don't think many give a thought. 

It's networking. It’s making connections. It’s making buddies. 

When you make yourself a part of the community, you get to know the regulars 
and some of those regulars can become not only friends, but those connections 
could lead into big things. 

And it’s so easy. 

Simple engage with others on the forum. 

Mention other members by name. 

Here’s how to make it even easier… treat it like real life interactions. 

When we talk to people face to face, do we go on and on about ourselves? Not if 
we want to make or keep our friends. 

In real life, do we speak with others as if we did not even hear what they said? Of 
course not. 

We know how it works in the flesh, but for whatever reason, when it comes to 
online, far too many don’t seem to care much about others. They speak as if they 
are the only one in the room. 

Don’t get me wrong, most every forum has a core group that do make themselves 
a part of the community. They get it. 

Now let’s talk about… 
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Use Your Real Picture 

Most people don’t like pictures of themselves. Well, unless you’re a Kardashian. 

But, if you want to build a real reputation, along with your real name, your real 
picture is another part of the equation. 

And, please, if you’re serious about this, DON’T use a picture of a celebrity. Or a 
cartoon character. 

Be REAL. 

While we are on the subject… 

No Hot Girls Allowed 

It’s an age old tactic, but some “marketers” still think they will gain in some way if 
their profile picture is some scantily clad hot girl. It might get them some hits or 
attention, but rarely do those kind of members last. I doubt it even get’s them the 
kind of attention they want. Though, I guess it depends on what they are selling. 

But, who is even going to take that kind of member seriously? 

It’s not a good long term strategy. 

And frankly it can be a little creepy if you ask me. 

Not to mention, it’s not exactly professional. 

If that matters. 
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It’s already been said 

Sure I am not the only one that gets annoyed when people say the exact same 
thing that someone else has already said. 

It’s like really? Didn’t someone already say that? Didn’t I just say that? 

If you’re going to repeat what’s already been posted, at the very least 
acknowledge the person(s) that’s already said it. And add something extra or 
something or value. Otherwise, what’s the sense of replying? You’ll just look like a 
fool. 

Plus, this all goes back to building relationships with other members. 
Acknowledging what another member has said gives you’re the opportunity to 
connect with them. 

Thank You Goes A Long Way 

If you ask a question on a forum, or ask for a review of your website, or anything 
else you might want to know, make sure to thank those who have given a good 
response. They’ve taken their time to help you; they at least deserve some 
appreciation. 

Not only is it the proper way to show your appreciation, but it can be a step to 
forging relationships with others on the forum. 

The End… 

Obviously this was not meant to be a complete guide on proper and successful 
forum marketing, but I hope it’s been helpful. 

Do you have anything to add? 

Is Forum Marketing a part of your promotional routine? 
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I’d love to hear what you have to say, so please leave a comment below.  

http://www.theplrstore.com/forum-marketing-tips-boost-business.html 

Don’t be shy now. 

Tag! You’re it. 

And, as always if you’ve enjoyed this post, please share it on all your favorite 
social platforms. 

Did you fart? 

To your success! 

Ron Killian 

http://www.theplrstore.com 

 

Resources: 

thePLRstore.com –The quickest and easiest way to create your own products 

and you keep 100% of the profits! Largest selection of PLR Articles on the planet, 

in most every niche market. Also includes ebooks, graphics, software, templates, 

video, Web Audio and more. You become the expert and author! 

 

Profit Tweaks - If you're struggling to make money online, or it's been tough to 

build a profitable online business, this is the site for you. We cover many ways 

you can easily earn a full time income online, from the comfort of your home. 

Best of all, it's FREE to join! 

 

http://www.theplrstore.com/forum-marketing-tips-boost-business.html
http://www.theplrstore.com/
http://www.theplrstore.com/
http://www.profittweaks.com/
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Upgraded Traffic Tactics – Never again struggle generating traffic to your website. 

We have the videos that will SHOW you how to bring cash in hand buyers to your 

web properties. Today is the day you’ll know how it’s done. We’ll tell you how to 

get ranked in the Search Engines, use social marketing and so much more. Plus, 

it's FREE to join! 

 

Quick IM Videos – Stop wasting time, and getting frustrated, and do it the easy 

way by learning exactly what you need to know quickly. Find out how simple and 

easy it is to get up and making money. 

 

 

 

http://www.upgradedtraffictactics.com/
http://www.quickimvideos.com/

